
 
 
ABK-Egypt Online Banking Disclaimer 

Disclaimer  
By accessing this site, you are bound by the given terms and conditions. Please read them 
carefully. If you do not agree to the terms and conditions provided, you will not gain access 
to the site and the pages inside. 
 
Use of information and Material  
The Bank holds no responsibility in case of any irregularities found in the content which is 
also subject to change. All service and products may not be available at all times nor are they 
applicable to all people. The eligibility to avail these products and services is at the discretion 
of the Bank and their decision will be final.  
 
Warranty  
The Bank takes no responsibility for the information and material available on the site and 
does not issue any “Warranty” of accuracy, security and protection from virus, for its 
products and services. There may be delays and omissions as well as mistakes in the 
products, services, or the information provided. The Bank also does not promise that the 
products and services available through the site would be uninterrupted and error free.  
 
Hyperlinks  
The hyperlinks found on our site are not endorsed by the Bank in any way and any user who 
wishes to visit them must do so at their own risk. The Bank does not take responsibility for 
the content, or the expressed opinions or authenticity of these sites.  
 
User Protection  
It is the responsibility of the user to safeguard their confidential information. Take care not 
to divulge your User ID and password (or Debit/Credit Card number and PIN) to any 
unknown third party whether intentionally or accidentally. The possible transaction the 
unauthorized user may make is not the responsibility of the Bank. It is of course essential to 
inform the right authorities in case of loss of/unauthorised or potential/threatened loss of/ 
unauthorised use of User ID and password. At such an occasion the Bank will block the 
respective account from gaining any further access. However, if an access has already been 
made, then that transaction would be considered valid and the user will be liable for it.  
 
Damages and Losses  
Under no circumstances is the Bank to be held liable for any kind of damages or extra 
expenses which the customer may have to bear to use the site or in case of inability to use 
the site on any event. Damages, whether direct or indirect, special, incidental, or 
consequential or in respect to any failure of performance, error, omission, interruption, 
defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus or line or system failure must also 
be borne by the customer.  
 
Submission  
The information submitted by the visitors to this site shall be considered as the property of 
the Bank. The Bank can then choose to use this information be it the ideas, concepts, know-
how or techniques, in any way it sees fit. This lack of confidentiality or obligation does not 
extend to the information which is provided by the direct customer, or as otherwise 
specifically agreed or required by law. 


